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No. 2815 Serjeant Albert Gill, late King's
UJoyal Rifle Corps.

For most conspicuous bravery. The enemy
made a very strong counter-attack on the
right flank of the battalion, and rushed the
bombing post after killing all the company
bombers.

Serjeant Gill at once rallied the remnants
of his platoon, none of whom were skilled
bombers, and reorganised his defences, a
most difficult and dangerous task, the trench
being very shallow and much damaged.
Soon afterwards the enemy nearly sur-
rounded his men by creeping up through the
thick undergrowth, and commenced sniping
at about twenty yards range. Although it
-was almost certain death, Serjeant Gill stood
boldly up in order to direct the fire of his
men. He was killed almost at once, but not
before he had shown his men where the
enemy were, and thus enabled them to hold
up their advance.

By his supreme devotion to duty and self-
sacrifice he saved a very dangerous situation.

14951 Serjeant David Jones, Liverpool Regi-
tment.

For most conspicuous bravery, devotion to
duty, and ability displayed in the handling
of his platoon.

The platoon to which he belonged was
ordered to a forward position, and during the
advance came under heavy machine gun fire,
the officer being killed and the platoon
suffering heavy losses.

Serjeant Jones led forward the remainder,
occupied the position, and held it for two
days and two nights without food or water,
until relieved. On the second day he drove
back three counter-attacks, inflicting heavy
losses. His coolness was most praiseworthy.
Iti was due entirely to his resource and
example that his men retained confidence and
held their post.

No. 13301 Lance-Serjeant Fred McNess,
33cots Guards.

For most conspicuous bravery. During a
severe engagement he led his men on with
the greatest dash in face of heavy shell and
machine gun fire. When the first line of
enemy trenches was readied, it was found
that the left flank was exposed and that the
enemy was bombing down the trench.

Serjeant McNess thereupon organised a
counter-attack and led it in person. He was
very severely wounded in the neck and jaw,
but went on passing through the barrage of
hostile bombs in order to bring up fresh sup-
plies of bombs to his own men.

Finally he established a " block," and con-
tinued encouraging his men and throwing
bombs till utterly exhausted by loss of blood.

No. 73132 Private (Acting Corporal) Leo
'Clarke, Can. Inf.

For most conspicuous bravery. He was
detailed with his section of bombers to clear
the continuation of a newly-captured trench
and cover the construction of a "block."
After most of his party had become casual-
ties, he was building a " block " when about

* twenty of the enemy with two officers
counter-attacked. He boldly advanced
against them, emptied his revolver into them

and afterwards two enemy rifles which he
picked up in the trench.

One of the officers then, attacked him with
the bayonet, wounding him in the leg, but he
shot him dead. The enemy then ran away,
pursued by Acting Corporal Clarke, who
shot four more and captured a fifth.

Later he was ordered to the dressing-
station, but returned next day to duty.

No. 3/5027 Private Thomas Hughes, Con-
naught Rangers.

For most conspicuous bravery and deter-
mination. He was wounded in an attack,
but returned at once to the firing line after
having his wounds dressed.

Later, seeing a hostile machine-gun, he
dashed out in front of his company, shot the
gunner, and single-handed captured the gun.

Though again wounded, he brought back
three or four prisoners.

No. 11000 Private Thomas Alfred Jones,
Cheshire Regiment.

For most conspicuous bravery. He was
with his company consolidating the defences
in front of a village, and, noticing an enemy
sniper at 200 yards distance, he went out,
and, though one bullet went through his
helmet and another through his coat, he re-
turned the sniper's fire and killed him. He
then saw two more of the enemy firing at
him, although displaying a white flag. Both
of these he also shot. On reaching the enemy
trench he found several occupied dug-outs,
and, single-handed, disarmed 102 of the
enemy, including three or four officers, and
marched them back to our lines through a
heavy barrage. He had been warned of the
misuse of the white flag by the enemy, but
insisted on going out after them.

101465 Private John Chipman Kerr, Cana-
dian Infantry.

For most conspicuous bravery. During a
bombing attack he was acting as bayonet
man, and, knowing that bombs were running
short, he ran along the parados under heavy
fire until he was in close contact with the
enemy, when he opened fire on them at point-
blank range, and inflicted heavy loss.

The enemy, thinking they were sur-
rounded, surrendered. Sixty-two prisoners
were taken and 250 yards of enemy trench
captured.

Before carrying out this very plucky act
one of Private Kerr's fingers had been blown
off by a bomb.

Later, with two other men, he escorted
back the prisoners under fire, and then
returned to report himself for duty before
having his wound dressed.

War Office,
26th October, 1916.

His Majesty the KING has been graciously
pleased -to award the Distinguished Conduct
Medal to the undermentioned. Non-Commie
sioued Officers and Men of No'.' 22nd Field
Ambulance, R.A.M.C., in recognition of great
devotion to duty and eminent services rendered


